
Sale Name: Production & Performance Prospects Horse Sale

LOT 10 - LADY IN BLUE

Year   2020

Color   BLUE ROAN 

Gender   MARE

Pedigree   LR HANCOCK WYO BLUE X LONDON BLUE LADY

Trainer   KYZER STODDARD

Phone   208-716-6268

Email   KYZER_STODDARD@HOTMAIL.COM

City   REXBURG

State   ID

Description

LADY IN BLUE

Lady in Blue or better known as Wonder is smart as they come. Being practically born
broke she leads great, loads in the trailer, stands tied for grooming, clipping, bathing
and the farrier. She loves to please and is a full sibling to the easiest starting colts I
have ever had the privilege of training. Her Dam London Blue Lady or mostly know as
Sugar stands 14.2 hands tall and is the best horse I have ever owned. She has been well
traveled all across the US and Canada performing in PRCA Specialty Acts, Wild West
shows, trick riding and roman riding as well as liberty performances.  She teams ropes
on both ends, done all aspects of ranch work with ease and helping to break new colts
to drive. She knows too many tricks to list but to name a few she can walk the arena on
her hind legs on cue, lay down, bow, smile, say yes and know, roll on her back four legs
in the air and balance me in a handstand between her front legs. From the intensity of
the performance arena to helping ease tension with a special needs child she excels



and knows how to adjust. Wonder’s Sire is  LR Hancock Wyo Blue standing 14.3 hands
tall with lots of bone and big feet being Homozygous Roan is a son of Revue Hancock,
an own son of Hancocks Blue Boy, Revue Hancock is a line bred Joe Hancock / Blue
Valentine, 91% foundation stallion bred by the famous Broken Bones Ranch in
Wyoming. Hancocks Blue Boy’s offspring have qualified for the World Show in tie-
down roping, team roping heading and heeling. Revue Hancock is a true blue roan who
is the sire of proven rodeo performance horses, including NRHA, NCHA, PRCA,
USTRCA, NHSRA, Barrel Futurity winners, as well as, halter, dressage and western
pleasure champions . Everyone familiar with this bloodline will know they are superior
ranch and using horses because of their athletic ability, sound bone, and quiet
dispositions. Tune into my youtube channel https://youtube.com/user/kyzerstoddard
as we will be uploading videos daily and to see videos of her dam performing in the
past. For more information call or text Kyzer Stoddard (208)716-6268.

Quantity: 1
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