
Sale Name: RENO ~ Diamonds In The Desert Premier Horse Sale 

LOT 36 - BLUE STREAKIN BULLY

Year   2017

Breed   AQHA

Gender   Gelding

Height   14.2

Trainer   Buckeye Acre Farm

Email   buckeyeacrefarm@gmail.com

Phone   (330)-231-2324

Location   OH

Description

BLUE STREAKIN BULLY

Take a look here!! A true Blue Roan Quarter Horse gelding. He is not only easy on the
eyes with his nice long neck that comes right out of the top of his withers, he has the
personality to get any job done and done right. Frosty’s registered name is Blue
Streakin Bully and he is a 2017 gelding that stands 14.2 hands tall. He has a pedigree
that takes him back to AQHA hall of famer Streakin Six on the top side and the three
million dollar earning Premier Performing Stallion Sun Frost on the bottom side. He
has that willingness to learn attitude that was imprinted into him through his genetics
which has made him one of the easiest horses to bring through our program. He has a
no nonsense way about him and picks any new thing we show him up with ease. He has
spent much of his life as a trail horse going over a lot of different terrain, through
water, over lots of different bridges and he goes without ever causing a fuss. He has
been used to check the fences, work some cows and just be that all around horse for
anyone to enjoy. We have shot the gun off of him, thrown the tarp, rode with the flag
at our side and taken him to several different places. He will go onto any type of



trailer, and come off the same no matter where we take him. He is great for the farrier
and stands quiet in the cross ties. He is a horse that can sit for a long time and no
matter how much or how little you want to work with him, he will always be the same.
Frosty has three very smooth gaits and knows his leads well. He can be ridden western
with a great neck rein, or he goes English as well. He is fun to ride bareback with his
smooth gaits and willingness way about him. He has been kept in a stall and out in the
field and he does not have any bad habits. We have owned this guy for 2 years and are
looking forward to sharing him with his new forever home. For more information on
him, please give Duane Yoder of Buckeye Acre Farm a call at 330-231-2324.

Quantity: 1

https://bid.premieronlinesales.com/


